

**CANAVERAL PORT AUTHORITY
BID TABULATION SHEET**

BID #/NAME: PUR-RFP-23-1 Step 2
NCB4 Rehabilitation & Modernization

BID DUE DATE/TIME: March 29, 2023
2:00 PM

Contractor	BASE BID ITEM 1 - Lump Sum For: All work shown on drawings entitled "NCB 4 REHABILITATION AND MODERNIZATION" excluding dredging	BASE BID ITEM 2 - Lump Sum For: All costs to Mob/Demob for all Dredging Works	BASE BID ITEM 3 - Lump Sum For: All work to dredge 71,500 cubic yards at NCB 4 and place the spoil in the Off-Shore Disposal Site	ALLOWANCES as defined and identified in Section 01 21 16	SUM OF BASE BID ITEM 1, BASE BID ITEM 2, BASE BID ITEM 3, AND ALLOWANCE	ALTERNATE 1 - Lump Sum for all cost to substitute steel pipe piles for the relieving platform prestressed precast concrete piling as generally shown on drawing sheet S-405 Additive / Deductive	Schedule Impact to Original Substantial Completion - Alternate 1 Increase / Decrease Calendar Days	ALTERNATE 2 - Lump Sum for all cost to elevate the top of the combi-wall steel pipe and SSP piles including modifications to combi-wall and the reinforced concrete cap, without changing the combi-wall pile tip elevations, as generally shown on drawing sheet S-605. Additive / Deductive	Schedule Impact to Original Substantial Completion - Alternate 2 Increase / Decrease Calendar Days
Orion Marine Construction Inc - Tampa, FL	34,745,688.00	1,214,779.00	1,680,250.00	1,000,000.00	38,640,717.00	3,500,000.00	0	250,000.00	0
RUSH Marine LLC - Titusville, FL	38,074,156.44	1,260,311.00	1,593,735.00	1,000,000.00	41,928,202.44	3,086,539.00	-10	234,735.00	+14
Vecellio & Grogan Inc - Winter Park, FL	44,137,425.00	1,271,000.00	1,544,400.00	1,000,000.00	47,952,825.00	3,300,000.00	+120	335,000.00	+30
Manson Construction Co - Seattle, WA	56,191,029.00	1,150,000.00	1,408,550.00	1,000,000.00	59,749,579.00	3,996,000.00	0	280,000.00	0
Kiewit Infrastructure South Co - Orlando, FL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Triton Marine Construction Corp - Bremerton, WA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No bid	No Bid

THIS BID TAB WILL BE PRESENTED TO THE CANAVERAL PORT AUTHORITY AT ITS REGULARLY SCHEDULED MEETING ON APRIL 5, 2023 FOR A DECISION REGARDING AWARD.

POSTED : DATE March 29, 2023 BY: Karen Pappas, Director Procurement

THIS IS NOTICE OF THE DECISION OF THE CANAVERAL PORT AUTHORITY TO AWARD THE CONTRACT TO: Orion Marine Construction, Inc.

POSTED: DATE April 6, 2023 BY: Karen Pappas, Director Procurement